
SB2266
00915117

-1-

Filed for intro on  01/20/2000

SENATE BILL 2266
By  Springer

AN ACT  to amend Tennessee Code Annotated, Title 68, Chapter
55, Part 3, relative to additional fines to be deposited into
Traumatic Brain Injury Fund.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE GENERAL ASSEMBLY OF THE STATE OF TENNESSEE:

SECTION 1.  Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 68-55-301, is amended by deleting

the words and figures "two dollars ($2.00)" and by substituting instead the words and figures

"five dollars ($5.00)".

SECTION 2.  Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 68-55-302, is amended by deleting

the words and figures "twenty-five dollars ($25.00)" and by substituting instead the words and

figures "thirty dollars ($30.00)".

SECTION 3.  Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 68-55-303, is amended by deleting

the words and figures "ten dollars ($10.00)" and by substituting instead the words and figures

"fifteen dollars ($15.00)".

SECTION 4.  Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 68-55-304, is amended by deleting

the words and figures "ten dollars ($10.00)" and by substituting instead the words and figures

"fifteen dollars ($15.00)".



- 2 - 00915117

SECTION 5.  This act shall take effect upon becoming a law, the public welfare requiring

it.


